

**ABSTRACT OF BIDS AS READ****Project Name: SUPPLY & DELIVERY OF MEDICINES**

Project Location: N C H

Implementing Office: N C H

Approved Budget for the Contract : **P 1,249,750.26**

Sheet: 1

Date: April 8, 2015

Time: 03:00 PM

Venue: City Procurement Office

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR	ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GENERAL MERCHANDISE	ENDURE MEDICAL, INC.				
1	2,000	tab	Acarbose 50 mg tab : ORAL	17,640.00	NO BID	NO BID	39,000.00				
2	288	btl	225 mg Aluminum Hydroxide 200 mg Magnesium Hydroxide / 5 ml susp 120 ml : ORAL	5,702.40	5,685.12	NO BID	NO BID				
3	20,000	tab	Amlodipine 10 mg tab ( as besilate/camsylate ) : ORAL	10,760.00	10,600.00	NO BID	17,800.00				
4	4,000	cap	Amoxicillin 250 mg cap ( as trihydrate ) : ORAL	3,600.00	3,480.00	3,520.00	NO BID				
5	20,000	cap	Amoxicillin 500 mg cap (as trihydrate ) : ORAL	29,000.00	28,600.00	28,800.00	26,400.00				
6	120	vl	Ampicillin 500 mg vl ( IM, IV ) ( as sodium salt ) : INJ.	726.00	NO BID	NO BID	1,182.00				
7	5,000	tab	Ascorbic Acid ( Vitamin C ) 500 mg tab : ORAL	2,950.00	2,900.00	2,900.00	NO BID	winner by tossed coin			
8	288	btl	Ascorbic Acid ( Vitamin C ) 100 mg / 5 ml syr 60 ml : ORAL	3,240.00	3,219.84	3,234.24	NO BID				
9	400	tab	Atenolol 50 mg tab : ORAL	600.00	584.00	NO BID	568.00				
10	40	vl	Biphasic Isophane human insulin 70/30 ( recombinant DNA ) 70 % isophane suspension + 30% soluble insulin in 100 iu / ml 10 ml vl ( IM, IV ) : INJ.	13,778.00	NO BID	NO BID	8,740.00				
11	400	tab	Bisacodyl 5 mg tab : ORAL	340.00	340.00	332.00	NO BID				


Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR	ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GENERAL MERCHANDISE	ENDURE MEDICAL, INC.				
12	50	suppository	Bisacodyl 5 mg ( children ) supp : RECTAL	1,390.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID				
13	100	suppository	Bisacodyl 10 mg ( adult ) supp : RECTAL	2,780.00	2,780.00	NO BID	1,989.00				
14	5,000	tab	Butamirate 50 mg SR tab ( as citrate ) : ORAL	51,000.00	50,000.00	48,900.00	NO BID				
15	4,000	tab	Carvedilol 6.25 mg tab : ORAL	8,840.00	8,800.00	NO BID	8,760.00				
16	30,000	cap	Cefalexin 500 mg cap ( as monohydrate ) : ORAL	51,000.00	50,700.00	50,400.00	NO BID				
17	144	btl	Cefixime 20 mg / ml granules for drops / suspension 10 ml : ORAL	41,760.00	NO BID	40,032.00	NO BID				
18	1,000	vl	Cefuroxime 750 mg vl ( IM, IV ) ( as sodium salt ) : INJ.	18,900.00	NO BID	NO BID	17,200.00				
19	12,000	cap	Celecoxib 200 mg cap : ORAL	96,000.00	79,800.00	76,800.00	NO BID				
20	150	amp / vl	Chlorphenamine ( Chlorpheniramine ) 10 mg / ml 1 ml amp / vl ( IM, IV ) ( as maleate ) : INJ.	1,470.00	NO BID	NO BID	1,464.00				
21	12,000	cap	Clindamycin 300 mg cap ( as hydrochloride ) : ORAL	21,600.00	21,600.00	NO BID	21,480.00				
22	20,000	cap	Cloxacillin 500 mg cap ( as sodium salt ) : ORAL	35,880.00	35,200.00	46,000.00	NO BID				
23	6,000	tab	Co- Amoxiclav ( Amoxicillin + potassium clavulanate ) 500 mg amoxicillin ( as trihydrate ) 125 mg potassium clavulanate / tab : ORAL	71,280.00	70,560.00	NO BID	70,740.00				
24	288	btl	Cotrimoxazole ( sulfamethoxazole + trimethoprim ) 200 mg sulfamethoxazole 40 mg trimethoprim / 5 ml susp 60 ml : ORAL	3,525.12	3,519.36	<b>3,519.36</b>	NO BID	winner by tossed coin			
25	20	amp	Digoxin 250 mcg / ml 2 ml amp ( IM, IV ) : INJ.	2,597.60	NO BID	NO BID	2,590.00				

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR	ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GENERAL MERCHANDISE	ENDURE MEDICAL, INC.				
26	300	tube	Fluocinonide 0.5 % 5 g tube : CREAM	68,100.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID				
27	150	amp	Furosemide 10 mg / ml 2 ml amp ( IM, IV ) : INJ.	582.00	NO BID	NO BID	582.00				
28	400	tab	Glibenclamide 5 mg tab : ORAL	152.00	148.00	152.00	NO BID				
29	10,000	tab	Gliclazide 80 mg tab : ORAL	27,000.00	26,800.00	27,000.00	NO BID				
30	4,000	tab	Hyoscine 10 mg tab ( as N-Butylbromide ) : ORAL	8,200.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID				
31	150	amp	Hyoscine 20 mg / ml 1 ml amp ( IM, IV, SC ) ( as N-butylbromide ) : INJ.	1,935.00	NO BID	NO BID	1,798.50				
32	1,600	tab	Irbesartan 150 mg tab : ORAL	33,680.00	NO BID	31,824.00	NO BID				
33	340	vl	Isophane Insulin Human ( Recombinant DNA ) 100 iu / ml 10	95,030.00	NO BID	NO BID	72,080.00				
34	144	btl	Lactulose 3.3 g / 5 ml ( 66% ) syr 120 ml : ORAL	16,992.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID				
35	864	btl	Vitex Negundo L. ( Lagundi Leaf ) 300 mg / 5 ml syr : ORAL	55,468.80	45,696.96	51,062.40	NO BID				
36	400	cap	Loperamide 2 mg cap ( as hydrochloride ) : ORAL ( N. B. not for infants and children )	172.00	172.00	NO BID	NO BID				
37	200	tab / cap	Mebendazole 100 mg tab / cap : ORAL	176.00	NO BID	176.00 (500 mg)	NO BID				
38	20,000	tab / cap	Mefenamic Acid 500 mg tab / cap : ORAL	8,400.00	8,200.00	NO BID	9,800.00				
39	150	amp	Metoclopramide 5 mg / ml 2 ml amp ( IM, IV ) ( as base and as hydrochloride ) : INJ.	487.50	NO BID	NO BID	486.00				
40	8,000	tab	Metoprolol 100 mg tab ( as tartrate ) : ORAL	11,360.00	11,120.00	11,120.00	NO BID	winner by tossed coin			

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR	ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GENERAL MERCHANDISE	ENDURE MEDICAL, INC.				
41	144	btl	Multivitamins / ml drops : ORAL	1,893.60	1,889.28	1,870.56	NO BID				
42	100	tube	Mupirocin 2% 5 g : CREAM	14,900.00	NO BID	14,400.00	8,946.00				
43	4,000	tab	Norfloxacin 400 mg tab : ORAL	6,600.00	6,080.00	NO BID	NO BID				
44	20,000	cap	Omeprazole 20 mg cap : ORAL	31,996.00	31,400.00	NO BID	27,200.00				
45	1,440	btl	Paracetamol ( Acetaminophen ) 120 mg / 5 ml ( 125 mg / 5 ml ) syr / susp 60 ml ( alcohol free ) : ORAL	17,524.80	17,481.60	17,424.00	NO BID				
46	100	suppository	Paracetamol 125 mg supp : RECTAL	2,780.00	2,759.00	NO BID	2,745.00				
47	80	amp	Phytomenadione ( Phytionadione, Vitamin K1 ) 10 mg / ml 1 ml amp ( IM, IV, SC ) ( as aqueous colloidal solution with benzyl alcohol ) : INJ.	1,407.20	1,406.40	1,400.00	1,399.20				
48	50	vl	Regular Insulin ( Recombinant DNA, Human ) 100 iu / ml 10 ml vl ( IM, IV, SC ) : INJ.	13,724.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID				
49	500	tab / cap	Rifampicin 450 mg tab / cap : ORAL	1,610.00	NO BID	1,590.00	NO BID				
50	10	vl	Sodium Bicarbonate 1 meq / ml 10 ml vl ( pediatric ) ( IV Inf ) : INJ.	972.50	NO BID	NO BID	964.90				
51	1,500	amp	Tetanus Toxoid 0.5 ml amp ( IM ) : INJ.	52,500.00	NO BID	NO BID	59,175.00				
52	50,000	tab / cap	Vitamin B1 B6 B12 100 mg 5 mg 50 mcg / tab / cap : ORAL	29,000.00	28,500.00	29,000.00	NO BID				
53	360	btl	5 % Dextrose in Lactated Ringer's 1 L bot ( IV Inf ) : INJ.	15,660.00	NO BID	NO BID	15,642.00				
54	960	btl	5 % Dextrose in 0.3 % Sodium Chloride 500 ml bot ( IV Inf ) : INJ.	41,760.00	NO BID	NO BID	33,552.00				
55	60	btl	5 % Dextrose in 0.9 % Sodium Chloride 1 L bot ( IV Inf ) : INJ.	2,715.00	NO BID	NO BID	2,697.00				

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR	ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GENERAL MERCHANDISE	ENDURE MEDICAL, INC.				
56	1,152	btl	0.9 % Sodium Chloride 1 L bot ( IV Inf ) : INJ.	50,112.00	NO BID	NO BID	40,262.40				
57	192	btl	Lactated Ringer's Solution ( Ringer's lactate ) 500 ml bot ( IV Inf ) : INJ.	8,688.00	NO BID	NO BID	6,710.40				
58	240	btl	Lactated Ringer's Solution ( Ringer's lactate ) 1 L bot ( IV Inf ) : INJ.	10,584.00	NO BID	NO BID	10,572.00				
59	48	btl	Mannitol 20 % 500 ml bot ( IV ) : INJ.	6,042.24	NO BID	NO BID	3,832.80				
60	1,000	set	IV Cannula G 20	13,660.00	13,600.00	NO BID	13,490.00				
61	1,000	set	IV Cannula G 22	17,580.00	17,570.00	NO BID	13,490.00				
62	1,000	set	IV Cannula G 24	15,200.00	15,180.00	NO BID	13,490.00				
63	12	amp	Bupivacaine Hydrochloride 5 mg / ml solution for spinal injection, 0.5% Heavy, 4 ml amp : Local Anesthetic	9,000.00	8,856.00	NO BID	3,540.00				
64	12	amp	Dexamethasone 4 mg / ml, 1 ml amp ( IM, IV ) ( as sodium phosphate ) :	1,200.00	NO BID	1,080.00	419.40				
65	12	amp	Ephedrine 50 mg / ml, 1 ml amp ( IM, IV ) ( as sulfate ) : INJ.	1,920.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID				
66	12	tube	Erythromycin eye ointment 0.5 %, 3.5 g tube : Eye Ointment	2,040.00	2,040.00	NO BID	NO BID				
67	12	amp	Fentanyl 50 mcg / ml, 2 ml amp ( IV ) ( as citrate ) : INJ.	4,560.00	NO BID	NO BID	4,428.00				
68	12	amp	Midazolam 5 mg / ml, 1 ml amp ( IM, IV ) : INJ.	1,320.00	NO BID	NO BID	1,314.00				
69	12	amp	Promethazine 25 mg / ml, 2 ml amp ( IM, IV ) ( as hydrochloride ) : INJ.	600.00	NO BID	NO BID	594.00				
70	12	set	Spinal Needle G 25	1,500.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID				
71	24	btl	Balanced Multiple Replacement Solution with 5 % Dextrose, 1 liter bot	1,086.00	NO BID	NO BID	1,084.80				
72	200	tab	Allopurinol 100 mg tab : ORAL	1,500.00	NO BID	1,000.00	NO BID				

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR	ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GENERAL MERCHANDISE	ENDURE MEDICAL, INC.				
73	400	tab	Cetirizine 10 mg tab ( as dihydrochloride ) : ORAL	8,300.00	820.00	2,000.00	316.00				
74	12	btl	Coal Tar 1 % 150 ml bot : Shampoo	2,400.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID				
75	200	tab	Colchicine 500 mcg tab : ORAL	600.00	NO BID	500.00	NO BID				
76	1,000	tab	Lagundi 600 mg tab : ORAL	4,500.00	4,480.00	4,200.00	NO BID				
77	5,000	tab	Losartan 50 mg tab ( as potassium salt ) : ORAL	20,000.00	16,950.00	18,500.00	8,450.00				
78	12	btl	3.5 mg neomycin ( as sulfate ) + 10,000 units polymixin B ( as sulfate ) + 0.025 % fluocinolone acetonide / ml, 5 ml bot : Ear Drops Solution	3,000.00	NO BID	2,760.00	NO BID				
79	12	btl	Ofloxacin 0.3 % 5 ml bot : Ear Drops Solution	2,220.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID				
80	200	tab	Spironolactone 25 mg tab : ORAL	3,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID				
<b>TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID</b>				<b>1,249,750.26</b>	<b>639,517.56</b>	<b>521,320.56</b>	<b>576,974.40</b>				
Form of Bid Security					BSD	BSD	BSD				
Bank/Company					N/A	N/A	N/A				
Number					N/A	N/A	N/A				
Validity Period					N/A	N/A	N/A				
Bid Security Amount					N/A	N/A	N/A				
Required Bid Security					N/A	N/A	N/A				
Sufficient/Insufficient					N/A	N/A	N/A				
Remarks					ELIGIBLE	ELIGIBLE	ELIGIBLE				

  
**FLORENCIO T. MONGOSO, JR.**  
Chairman, BAC

  
**ARTHUR F. ABONAL**  
Member

  
**LEON B. PALMIANO IV**  
Vice Chairman, BAC

  
**REVEL M. OLIVER**  
Member

  
**PERFECTO N. BRAGAIS III**  
Member

  
**FRANK M. MENDOZA**  
Member

PMO-End-user Unit

MNCCI Rep.-Observer

NCPC Rep.- Observer

COA Rep. - Observer