

Standard Form Number: SF-GOOD-40
Revised on: May 24, 2004**ABSTRACT OF BIDS AS READ**Project Name: **SUPPLY & DELIVERY OF MEDICINES**

Sheet: 1

Project Location: C H O

Date: February 4, 2015

Implementing Office: C H O

Time: 03:00 PM

Approved Budget for the Contract : P 1,717,788.86

Venue: City Procurement Office

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	RBC-MDC CORP.	ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GEN. MDSE.	NATRAPHARM, INC.	GETZ BROS. PHILS. INC.	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR	UNITED LABORATORIES, INC.	
1	1,000	sachets	Acetylcysteine 200 mg Sachet	22,100.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
2	144	bottles	Al Hydroxide + Magnesium Hydroxide 200mg. Suspension 120ml	3,225.60	NO BID	5,760.00	NO BID	NO BID	2,129.76	NO BID	
3	432	bottles	Ambroxol Syrup 60 ml	7,430.40	NO BID	6,998.40	NO BID	NO BID	7,248.96	NO BID	
4	2,000	tablets	Ambroxol 30 mg Tablet	900.00	NO BID	900.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
5	10,000	tablets	Amlodipine besilate 5 mg Tablet	9,000.00	NO BID	8,500.00	NO BID	NO BID	6,400.00	NO BID	
6	144	bottles	Ascorbic Acid Syrup	2,476.80	NO BID	2,304.00	NO BID	NO BID	1,872.00	NO BID	
7	2,000	tablets	Atorvastatin 80 mg Tablet	42,400.00	NO BID	NO BID	36,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
8	300	ampoules	Anti-Tetanus Serum (ATS) 1,500 i.u. ampoule	7,002.00	NO BID	7,002.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
9	72	bottles	Azithromycin 200 mg/5 ml/20 ml Suspension	24,480.00	NO BID	22,320.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
10	100	tablets	Azithromycin 500 mg Tablet	10,500.00	NO BID	8,700.00	10,464.00	NO BID	2,945.00	NO BID	
11	100	vials	Benzatine Penicillin 1.2 ml u	17,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
12	3,000	tablets	Betahistine 16 mg Tablet	46,500.00	NO BID	45,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	RBC-MDC CORP.	ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GEN. MDSE.	NATRAPHARM, INC.	GETZ BROS. PHILS. INC.	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR	UNITED LABORATORIES, INC.	
29	2,000	tablets	Cilostazol 50 mg Tablet	24,980.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	22,500.00	NO BID	22,940.00	
30	1,000	capsules	Citicoline 500 mg Capsule	50,970.00	NO BID	48,000.00	50,290.00	NO BID	39,780.00	NO BID	
31	1,000	capsules	Ciprofloxacin 500 mg Capsule	3,950.00	NO BID	3,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	1,680.00	NO BID	
32	144	bottles	Clarithromycin 125 mg Suspension 50 ml	26,568.00	NO BID	25,920.00	NO BID	19,656.00	19,872.00	NO BID	
33	2,000	capsules	Clindamycin 300mg Capsule	18,400.00	NO BID	12,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	4,840.00	NO BID	
34	2,000	tablets	Clopidogrel 75 mg Tablet	19,300.00	NO BID	12,000.00	NO BID	19,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	
35	2,000	capsules	Cloxacillin (sodium salt) 500 mg Capsule	7,000.00	NO BID	6,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	3,680.00	NO BID	
36	144	capsules	Cloxacillin (sodium salt) 125 mg Suspension	3,153.60	NO BID	3,096.00	NO BID	NO BID	2,160.00	NO BID	
37	500	tablets	Clozapine 100 mg Tablet	26,000.00	18,600.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	23,185.00	
38	288	bottles	Co-Amoxiclav 228 mg Suspension (50 ml)	54,432.00	NO BID	53,856.00	48,672.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
39	2,500	tablets	Co-Amoxiclav 625 mg Tablet	43,750.00	36,250.00	42,500.00	NO BID	NO BID	32,450.00	NO BID	
40	2,000	tablets	Colchicine 500mg Tablet	5,500.00	NO BID	4,600.00	NO BID	NO BID	5,500.00	NO BID	
41	72	bottles	Dicycloverine Hydrochloride 10 mg Syrup	11,052.00	NO BID	4,320.00	NO BID	NO BID	1,400.40	NO BID	
42	500	tablets	Dicycloverine Hydrochloride 10 mg Tablet	180.00	NO BID	175.00	NO BID	NO BID	170.00	NO BID	
43	1,500	tablets	Digoxin 250 mcg Tablet	6,150.00	NO BID	6,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	6,300.00	NO BID	
44	200	tablets	Doxofylline 400mg Tablet	2,700.00	NO BID	2,700.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	RBC-MDC CORP.	ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GEN. MDSE.	NATRAPHARM, INC.	GETZ BROS. PHILS. INC.	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR	UNITED LABORATORIES, INC.	
45	144	bottles	Ferrous Sulfate 200 mg Syrup	2,298.24	NO BID	2,260.80	NO BID	NO BID	2,298.24	NO BID	
46	10,000	tablets	Ferrous Sulfate Tablet (plain)	10,000.00	NO BID	7,500.00	NO BID	NO BID	4,600.00	NO BID	
47	1,000	tablets	Gabapentin 300 mg Tablet	32,000.00	11,200.00	30,000.00	NO BID	23,100.00	NO BID	NO BID	
48	100	bottles	Gentamicin Eye Drops .3%	11,800.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
49	1,000	tablets	Glimeperide 20mg Tablet	9,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
50	72	bottles	Ibuprofen 100mg/5ml - 60 ml Bottle	4,968.00	NO BID	4,464.00	NO BID	NO BID	3,888.00	NO BID	
51	50	ampoules	Insulin Glargine 100 u X 3ml	12,900.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
52	1,000	nebules	Ipratropium + salbutamol Nebule	17,500.00	NO BID	16,900.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
53	60	vials	Isophane Human Insulin 100 iu/ml 70/30 Vial	45,000.00	14,700.00	NO BID	NO BID	18,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	
54	500	tablets	Isoprinosine 500 mg Tablet	12,600.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
55	1,000	capsules	Isosorbide-5 Mononitrate 60 mg Capsule	11,490.00	NO BID	11,000.00	11,000.00	NO BID	10,980.00	NO BID	
56	100	tubes	Ketoconazole 20 mg/g Cream	7,750.00	NO BID	7,600.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
57	50	ampoules	Ketorolac 30 mg/ml Ampoule	1,605.00	NO BID	1,550.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
58	72	bottles	Levocetirizine hcl 2.5mg/5ml - 30 ml Bottle	7,416.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
59	1,500	tablets	Levocetirizine di Hcl 5 mg Tablet	18,000.00	NO BID	17,250.00	17,250.00	13,410.00	17,985.00	NO BID	
60	1,000	tablets	Levofloxacin 500mg Tablet	11,850.00	NO BID	11,750.00	NO BID	NO BID	11,600.00	NO BID	
61	5,000	tablets	Loratadine 10mg Tablet	10,950.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	10,900.00	NO BID	

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	RBC-MDC CORP.	ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GEN. MDSE.	NATRAPHARM, INC.	GETZ BROS. PHILS. INC.	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR	UNITED LABORATORIES, INC.	
62	5,000	tablets	Losartan 50 mg Tablet	18,250.00	NO BID	17,750.00	NO BID	15,000.00	10,000.00	NO BID	
63	200	tablets	Mebendazole 500mg Tablet	1,400.00	NO BID	1,200.00	NO BID	NO BID	560.00	NO BID	
64	144	bottles	Mefenamic Acid 50 mg/5 ml Suspension	2,157.12	NO BID	2,116.80	NO BID	NO BID	1,929.60	NO BID	
65	1,000	tablets	Metoclopramide 10mg Tablet	5,000.00	NO BID	3,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	1,160.00	NO BID	
66	5,000	tablets	Metoprolol 50 mg Tablet	4,900.00	NO BID	4,800.00	NO BID	NO BID	4,300.00	NO BID	
67	1,000	tablets	Metronidazole 500 mg Tablet	1,400.00	NO BID	1,300.00	NO BID	NO BID	730.00	NO BID	
68	100	vials	Metronidazole 500 mg Vial	2,229.00	NO BID	2,200.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
69	50	tubes	Mometasone Famoate Cream 5gm	14,750.00	NO BID	13,500.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
70	1,000	tablets	Montelukast 8 mg Tablet	21,000.00	NO BID	15,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
71	5,000	capsules	Multivitamin Capsule	20,000.00	NO BID	12,500.00	NO BID	NO BID	3,400.00	NO BID	
72	288	bottles	Multivitamin Drops	5,760.00	NO BID	5,184.00	NO BID	NO BID	4,115.52	NO BID	
73	720	bottles	Multivitamin Syrup	14,688.00	NO BID	12,960.00	NO BID	NO BID	9,172.80	NO BID	
74	200	tubes	Mupirocin 5 gms/tube	22,658.00	NO BID	22,580.00	NO BID	NO BID	22,596.00	NO BID	
75	200	tablets	Olanzapine 10mg Tablet	26,000.00	9,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
76	5,000	capsules	Omeprazole 40 mg Capsule	55,000.00	NO BID	50,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	34,650.00	NO BID	
77	100	vials	Omeprazole 40mg + 10ml Solvent Vial	7,489.00	NO BID	7,200.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
78	1,000	sachets	Oral Rehydration Solution (ORS) 2.17 gms Sachet	5,300.00	NO BID	4,900.00	NO BID	NO BID	4,500.00	NO BID	
79	100	ampoules	Paracetamol 150 mg/ml Ampoule	1,314.00	NO BID	1,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	1,310.00	NO BID	

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	RBC-MDC CORP.	ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GEN. MDSE.	NATRAPHARM, INC.	GETZ BROS. PHILS. INC.	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR	UNITED LABORATORIES, INC.	
96	100	ampoules	Tramadol 50 mg Ampoule	17,000.00	NO BID	3,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	2,600.00	NO BID	
97	1,500	capsules	Tramadol 50mg Capsule	12,000.00	NO BID	6,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	4,635.00	NO BID	
98	500	tablets	Tramadol 50 mg Tablet + Paracetamol 325 mg	10,000.00	NO BID	6,000.00	9,900.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
99	50	ampoules	Tranexamic Acid 500 mg Ampoule	287.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
100	1,500	tablets	Trimetazidine 35 mg Tablet	23,550.00	13,845.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	20,100.00	
101	1,500	tablets	Valporic Acid 500 mg Tablet	28,500.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	26,670.00	
102	10,000	tablets	Vitamin B1 B6 B12 mg+5+50mg Tablet (no other combination)	8,000.00	NO BID	7,800.00	NO BID	NO BID	6,900.00	NO BID	
103	144	bottles	Zinc Drops	11,016.00	NO BID	10,368.00	NO BID	NO BID	5,832.00	NO BID	
104	144	bottles	Zinc Syrup	11,664.00	NO BID	10,944.00	NO BID	NO BID	5,685.12	NO BID	
TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID				1,717,788.86	144,955.00	1,189,141.16	285,116.00	170,716.00	497,863.60	150,477.00	
Form of Bid Security					BSD	BSD	BSD	BSD	BSD	BSD	
Bank/Company					N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Number					N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Validity Period					N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Bid Security Amount					N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Required Bid Security					N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Sufficient/Insufficient					N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Remarks					ELIGIBLE	ELIGIBLE	ELIGIBLE	ELIGIBLE	ELIGIBLE	ELIGIBLE	


FLORENCIO T. MONGOSO, JR.
 Chairman, BAC


ARTHUR F. ABONAL
 Member


LEON B. PALMIANO IV
 Vice Chairman, BAC


REUEL M. OLIVER
 Member


PERFECTO N. BRAGAIS III
 Member


FRANK M. MENDOZA
 Member


GAUDENCIO A. ASIS, JR.
 Head, TWG