

Standard Form Number: SF-GOOD-40  
Revised on: May 24, 2004**ABSTRACT OF BIDS AS CALCULATED****Project Name: SUPPLY & DELIVERY OF MEDICAL SUPPLIES**Project Location: N C H  
Implementing Office: N C H

Approved Budget for the Contract : P 977,974.36

Sheet: 1  
Date: March 24, 2015  
Time: 03:00 PM  
Venue: City Procurement Office

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	BEROVAN MKTG. INC						
1	100	gals.	Alcohol 70%	13,200.00	5,980.00						
2	6	pieces	Autoclave tape 2" (3m)	3,049.20	NO BID						
3	6	pieces	Autoclave tape 1" (3m)	3,048.00	NO BID						
4	6	gals.	Benzol	17,136.00	NO BID						
5	12	pieces	BP cuff adult	1,908.00	1,800.00						
6	3	pieces	Chromic 1/0 round	5,610.00	540.00						
7	6	boxes	Chromic (3/0 12pcs/box)	21,431.52	12,960.00						
8	3	boxes	Chromic 4-0	9,741.60	6,372.00						
9	50	boxes	Clean gloves	13,069.00	6,750.00						
10	50	pieces	Cord clamp	300.00	NO BID						
11	6	pieces	Cylinder disc tall stainless	4,200.00	NO BID						
12	6	gals.	Denatured Alcohol	1,144.08	NO BID						
13	25	pieces	Digital thermometer with beeper	1,875.00	1,600.00						

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	BEROVAN MKTG. INC						
14	10	boxes	Disposable Needle g 23x1 (100pcs/box)	1,815.00	1,660.00						
15	10	boxes	Disposable Needle G25 5/8 (100pcs/box)	1,815.00	1,660.00						
16	500	gals.	Disinfectant	75,700.00	59,000.00						
17	24	pieces	Elastic bandage 4"	528.00	453.60						
18	3	pieces	Endotracheal tube 4.0	120.78	97.20						
19	6	pieces	Foley Catheter F 16	232.32	141.00						
20	1	bot.	Formaldehyde	500.00	NO BID						
21	36	gals.	Glutaraldehyde/Cidex/Metricide	58,212.00	40,168.80						
22	24	bots.	Hydrogen Peroxide (1L/bot)	869.04	840.00						
23	29	boxes	Insulin syringe (Ultrafine 100pcs/box)	23,961.25	19,314.00						
24	12	pieces	Kelly curve (large) 7"	7,200.00	NO BID						
25	12	pieces	Kelly pad	7,200.00	4,740.00						
26	36	tubes	Lubricating jelly, KY	10,397.52	4,320.00						
27	10	boxes	Lidocaine (50 polyamp/bot)	10,400.00	NO BID						
28	70	gals.	Liquid Soap	20,224.40	19,600.00						
29	100	sets	Nebulizer kit	5,445.00	3,200.00						
30	50	pieces	Nasal canula Oxygen (adult)	907.50	750.00						

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	BEROVAN MKTG. INC						
31	6	pieces	Nasogastric Tube NGT F16	69.30	68.40						
32	100	pieces	OR scrub brush disposable	5,000.00	1,200.00						
33	6	rolls	O. S.	6,930.00	5,988.00						
34	100	pieces	Oxygen face mask, adult	4,800.00	3,800.00						
35	100	pieces	Oxygen face mask, pedia	4,800.00	3,800.00						
36	205	tubes	Plaster	156,271.50	92,250.00						
37	10	gals.	Povidone Iodine 10%	8,058.60	6,659.50						
38	20	boxes	Prolene 3-0 (24pcs/box)	92,782.00	NO BID						
39	20	boxes	Prolene 4-0 (24pcs/box)	110,000.00	NO BID						
40	2	boxes	Prolene 5-0	15,600.00	15,000.00						
41	6	pieces	Scalpel Holder # 3	288.00	240.00						
42	6	pieces	Scalpel Holder # 4	288.00	240.00						
43	2	boxes	Silk 2/0 round needle	700.00	NO BID						
44	1	boxes	Silk strand 2/0	198.00	NO BID						
45	10	boxes	Silk 3/0 cutting	5,000.00	NO BID						
46	12	pieces	Stainless tray, large	5,100.00	2,760.00						
47	12	pieces	Stainless tray, medium	3,264.00	4,800.00						

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	BEROVAN MKTG. INC						
48	24	pieces	Stainless hypotray with cover (large) 18"x15"	10,200.00	NO BID						
49	24	pieces	Stainless hypotray with cover (small) 12"x18"	9,600.00	NO BID						
50	50	pieces	Stainless canister with cover (big)	23,750.00	<b>11,000.00</b>						
51	50	pieces	Stainless Canister with cover (small)	13,100.00	NO BID						
52	12	pieces	Stainless forcep holder long	4,800.00	NO BID						
53	12	pieces	Stainless bowl small	9,600.00	NO BID						
54	3	pieces	Stainless basin large	6,000.00	NO BID						
55	2	pieces	Stethoscope Pedia	10,584.00	<b>8,400.00</b>						
56	1	bot.	Sterillium	2,750.00	NO BID						
57	1	piece	Sterillium Dispenser ( foot operated )	2,000.00	NO BID						
58	1	box	Surgical Blade # 10	700.00	<b>350.00</b>						
59	45	boxes	Surgical Gloves size 7.5 (50pcs/box)	32,670.00	<b>30,600.00</b>						
60	6	pieces	Suction Tips Fr. 14	85.80	<b>73.50</b>						
61	6	pieces	Suction Tip # 6	85.80	NO BID						
62	6	pieces	Suction Tip # 8	85.80	<b>73.50</b>						
63	6	pieces	Suction Tip # 12	85.80	<b>73.50</b>						
64	6	pieces	Suction Tip # 16	85.80	<b>73.50</b>						
65	200	boxes	Surgical cap (OR use)	300.00	<b>240.00</b>						

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	BEROVAN MKTG. INC						
66	1	gal	Surdez	1,000.00	NO BID						
67	1	box	Surgical staple wire	200.00	NO BID						
68	1	piece	Surgical staple wire remover	1,395.00	500.00						
69	350	boxes	Surgical mask ear loop	29,645.00	NON-RESPONSIVE						
70	100	boxes	Syringe 3 cc (100pcs/box)	46,460.00	38,800.00						
71	25	boxes	Syringe 5cc g 21 (100pcs/box)	12,543.75	NO BID						
72	6	pieces	Tissue forceps with teeth	4,800.00	210.00						
73	300	bots.	Triple Distilled water (100 ml)	14,058.00	NO BID						
74	2	pieces	Weighing scale bathroom type	500.00	350.00						
75	2	pieces	Weighing Scale (for intake and output)	500.00	NO BID						
<b>TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID</b>				<b>977,974.36</b>	<b>419,496.50</b>						
Form of Bid Security					BSD						
Bank/Company					N/A						
Number					N/A						
Validity Period					N/A						
Bid Security Amount					N/A						
Required Bid Security					N/A						
Sufficient/Insufficient					N/A						
Remarks					COMPLYING						

  
**FLORENCIO T. MONGOSO, JR.**  
 Chairman, BAC

  
**ARTHUR F. ABONAL**  
 Member

  
**LEON B. PALMIANO IV**  
 Vice Chairman, BAC

  
**REUEL M. OLIVER**  
 Member

**PERFECTO N. BRAGAS III**  
 Member

  
**FRANK B. MENDOZA**  
 Member

  
**GAUBENCIO A. ASIS, JR.**  
 Head TWG

PMO-End-user Unit

MNCCI Rep. - Observer

NCPC Rep. - Observer

COA Rep. - Observer