

**ABSTRACT OF BIDS AS READ**Project Name: **Supply and Delivery of Medicines**

Project Location: CPNO

Implementing Office: CPNO

Approved Budget for the Contract : P 1,044,341.96

Sheet: 1  
Date: Sept. 21, 2015  
Time: 03:00 PM  
Venue: City Procurement Office

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GENERAL MERCHANDISE	ENDURE MEDICAL, INC.	GETZ BROS. PHILIPPINES, INC.	CARACHEM PHARMACEUTICALS, INC.	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR		
1	1,000	tab	Allopurinol 100 mg tab : ORAL	5,000.00	3,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	1,150.00	NO BID		
2	90	tab	Amiodarone 200 mg tab ( as hydrochloride) : ORAL	4,477.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
3	100	vl	Ampicillin 500 mg vl ( IM, IV ) ( as sodium salt ) : INJ.	544.00	NO BID	834.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
4	5,000	vl / amp	Anti Tetanus Serum ( equine ) 1500 iu / ml 1 ml vl / amp ( IM ) : INJ.	140,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	139,900.00	135,000.00		
5	15,000	tab	Ascorbic Acid ( Vitamin C ) 500 mg tab : ORAL	8,700.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	8,250.00	8,550.00		
6	288	btl	Ascorbic Acid ( Vitamin C ) 100 mg / 5 ml syr 60 ml : ORAL	3,219.84	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	3,211.20	3,211.20	winner by tossed coin	
7	200	tab	Aspirin 325 mg tab USP Grade : ORAL	482.00	460.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
8	500	tab	Atenolol 50 mg tab : ORAL	660.00	NO BID	310.00	NO BID	660.00	NO BID		
9	50	suppository	Bisacodyl 5 mg ( children ) supp : RECTAL	1,250.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
10	1,500	neb	Budesonide 250 meq / ml 2 ml ( unit dose ) : RESP. SOL'N. ( for nebulization)	42,000.00	NO BID	40,935.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
11	144	btl	Cefalexin 100 mg / ml granules / powder for drops 15 ml ( as monohydrate): ORAL	2,704.32	2,476.80	NO BID	NO BID	2,664.00	NO BID		
12	144	btl	Cefixime 20 mg / ml granules for drops / suspension 10 ml : ORAL	40,032.00	38,160.00	NO BID	NO BID	39,600.00	NO BID		
13	500	vl	Ceftriaxone 1 g vl 10 ml diluent ( IV ) ( as disodium / sodium salt ) : INJ.	12,650.00	NO BID	11,645.00	NO BID	12,500.00	12,600.00		
14	500	vl	Cefuroxime 750 mg vl ( IM, IV ) ( as sodium salt ) : INJ.	8,600.00	NO BID	11,645.00	NO BID	NO BID	8,600.00		



Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GENERAL MERCHANDISE	ENDURE MEDICAL, INC.	GETZ BROS. PHILIPPINES, INC.	CARACHEM PHARMACEUTICALS, INC.	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR		
32	1,500	tab	Isosorbide Dinitrate 5 mg tab : SUBLINGUAL	7,200.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
33	72	btl	Lactulose 3.3 g / 5 ml ( 66% ) syr 120 ml : ORAL	8,496.00	NO BID	NO BID	7,697.52	NO BID	NO BID		
34	5,000	tab	Lagundi 600 mg tab : ORAL	21,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	20,950.00	21,000.00		
35	2,160	btl	Vitex Negundo L. ( Lagundi Leaf ) 300 mg / 5 ml syr : ORAL	114,242.40	108,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	113,400.00	104,544.00		
36	500	tab	Levothyroxine 100 mcg tab ( as anhydrous sodium ) : ORAL	5,500.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
37	6	vl	Lidocaine 2 % , 50 ml vl ( epidural, local infiltration ) as hydrochloride : INJ	390.00	NO BID	383.34	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
38	1,500	cap	Loperamide 2 mg cap ( as hydrochloride ) : ORAL ( N. B. not for infants and children)	645.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	645.00	NO BID		
39	20,000	tab	Losartan 50 mg tab ( as potassiu salt ) : ORAL	33,800.00	NO BID	24,800.00	NO BID	33,200.00	22,400.00		
40	500	tab / cap	Mebendazole 100 mg tab / cap : ORAL	440.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	425.00	NO BID		
41	20,000	tab / cap	Mefenamic Acid 500 mg tab / cap : ORAL	8,200.00	NO BID	10,800.00	NO BID	NO BID	8,200.00		
42	300	tab	Methylprednisolone 4 mg tab : ORAL	2,985.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
43	20,000	tab	Metformin 500 mg tab / film coated tab ( as hydrochloride ) : ORAL	12,000.00	11,800.00	NO BID	NO BID	11,800.00	11,000.00		
44	72	btl	Metoclopramide 5 mg / 5 ml syr 60 ml ( as base and as hydrochloride ) : ORAL	1,259.28	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	1,242.00	NO BID		
45	500	tab	Metronidazole 500 mg tab : ORAL	290.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	285.00	NO BID		
46	20,000	tab / cap	Multivitamins tab / cap : ORAL	13,800.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	13,600.00	13,400.00		
47	3	amp	Naloxone 400 mcg / ml 1 ml amp ( IM, IV, SC ) ( as hydrochloride ) :	1,133.10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
48	20	amp	Nicardipine 1 mg / ml 10 ml amp ( IV ) ( as hydrochloride ) : INJ.	26,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	26,000.00		
49	1,500	cap	Nifedipine 5 mg cap : ORAL	1,650.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	1,635.00	NO BID		

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GENERAL MERCHANDISE	ENDURE MEDICAL, INC.	GETZ BROS. PHILIPPINES, INC.	CARACHEM PHARMACEUTICALS, INC.	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR		
50	50	amp	Oxytocin 5 iu / ml 1 ml amp ( IM, IV ) : INJ.	750.00	700.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	700.00	winner by tossed coin	
51	1,000	tab	Paracetamol ( Acetaminophen ) 300 mg ( 325 mg ) tab : ORAL	1,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
52	10,000	tab	Paracetamol ( Acetaminophen ) 500 mg tab : ORAL	2,300.00	NO BID	2,290.00	NO BID	2,200.00	2,300.00		
53	144	btl	Paracetamol ( Acetaminophen ) 100 mg / ml drops 15 ml ( alcohol free ) : ORAL	1,820.16	1,800.00	NO BID	NO BID	1,800.00	1,814.40	winner by tossed coin	
54	720	btl	Paracetamol ( Acetaminophen ) 120 mg / 5 ml ( 125 mg / 5 ml ) syr / susp 60 ml ( alcohol free ) : ORAL	8,712.00	8,625.60	NO BID	NO BID	8,690.40	8,640.00		
55	200	suppository	Paracetamol 125 mg supp : RECTAL	5,490.00	NO BID	4,866.00	NO BID	NO BID	5,130.00		
56	50	amp	Paracetamol 150 mg / 1 ml 2 ml amp: INJ	1,950.00	1,500.00	644.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
57	20	tab	Phenobarbital 15 mg tab : ORAL	28.60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
58	50	vl	Potassium Chloride 2 meq / ml 20 ml vl ( IV inf ) : INJ.	2,244.50	NO BID	2,244.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
59	50	vl	Regular Insulin ( Recombinant DNA, Human ) 100 iu / ml 10 ml vl ( IM, IV, SC ) : INJ.	13,724.50	NO BID	NO BID	12,500.00	NO BID	NO BID		
60	90	neb	Salbutamol 2 mg / ml 2.5 ml ( unit dose ) ( as sulfate ) : RESP. SOL'N. ( for nebulization )	1,350.00	1,350.00	476.10	NO BID	1,345.50	NO BID		
61	10,000	tab	Simvastatin 40 mg tab : ORAL	35,500.00	31,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	35,300.00	28,900.00		
62	200	tab	Spironolactone 25 mg tab : ORAL	3,068.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	3,050.00	NO BID		
63	4,000	amp	Tetanus Toxoid 0.5 ml amp ( IM ) : INJ.	140,000.00	NO BID	159,960.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
64	10	amp	Thiamine 100 mg / ml 1 ml amp / vl ( IV ) : INJ	1,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
65	50	amp	Tramadol 50 mg / ml 2 ml amp ( IM, IV, SC ) ( as hydrochloride ) : INJ.	564.50	NO BID	509.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
66	500	cap	Tranexamic Acid 250 mg cap : ORAL	1,450.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
67	500	cap / tab	Tranexamic Acid 500 mg cap / tab : ORAL	2,475.00	2,350.00	NO BID	NO BID	2,450.00	2,470.00		

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GENERAL MERCHANDISE	ENDURE MEDICAL, INC.	GETZ BROS. PHILIPPINES, INC.	CARACHEM PHARMACEUTICALS, INC.	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR		
68	30	amp	Tranexamic Acid 100 mg / ml 5 ml amp ( IM, IV ) : INJ.	825.00	807.00	488.70	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
69	20,000	tab / cap	Vitamin B1 B6 B12 100 mg 5 mg 50 mcg / tab / cap : ORAL	11,400.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	11,200.00	11,400.00		
70	48	btl	Balanced Multiple Maintenance Solution with 5 % Dextrose 1 L bot ( children and adults ) ( IV Inf ) : INJ. ( with acetate )	2,172.00	NO BID	2,165.76	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
71	10	btl	5 % Dextrose in Water 250 ml bot ( IV Inf and as vehicle for IV	300.00	NO BID	899.90	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
72	60	btl	5 % Dextrose in Water 1 L bot ( IV infusion and as vehicle for IV	1,789.20	NO BID	3,293.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
73	10	set	IV Cannula G 16	350.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
74	50	set	IV Cannula G 18	999.00	NO BID	649.50	NO BID	NO BID	900.00		
75	10	set	Spinal Needle G 25	149.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
<b>TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID</b>				<b>1,044,341.96</b>	<b>460,151.60</b>	<b>363,049.20</b>	<b>254,197.52</b>	<b>723,606.94</b>	<b>656,077.60</b>		
Form of Bid Security					BSD	BSD	BSD	BSD	BSD		
Bank/Company					N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A		
Number					N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A		
Validity Period					N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A		
Bid Security Amount					N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A		
Required Bid Security					N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A		
Sufficient/Insufficient					N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A		
Remarks					ELIGIBLE	ELIGIBLE	ELIGIBLE	ELIGIBLE	ELIGIBLE		

  
**FLORENCIO T. MONGOSO, JR.**  
 Chairman, BAC

  
**LEON B. PALMIANO IV**  
 Vice Chairman, BAC

  
**PERFECTO N. BRAGAIS III**  
 Member

  
**ARTHUR F. ABONAL**  
 Member

  
**REGIEL M. OLIVER**  
 Member

  
**FRANK M. MENDOZA**  
 Member