N City Govethment of Naga

Standard Form Number, SF-GO0D-40

Revised on: May 24, 2004

ABSTRACT OF BIDS AS CALCULATED

Projoct Reference Number: 2015034
Suppiy and Defvery of Farmily Planning Malerials

Project Name: Supply and Delivery of Medicines Sheet 1
Project Location: CPNO Date: Sept. 23, 2015
Implementing Office: CPNO Time; 02:00 PM
Approved Budget for the Contract : P 1,044,341.96 Venue: City Procurement Office
ONICARE JRAGS
femn . Approved Budget | - PHARMA ENDURE | GETZBROS. | CARACHEM | opsRMACEU.
Qty. Unit Items for the Contract TRADING & PHARMACEU-
No. MEDICAL, INC. |PHILIPPINES, INC. TICAL
(ABC) GENERAL TICALS, INC. DISTRIBUTOR
MERCHANDISE
. . NON-
1 1,000 tab Allopuringl 100 mg tab : ORAL 5,000.00 RESPONSIVE NOBID NO BID 1,150.00 NO BID
Amiodarone 200 mg tab ( as
2 90 tab hydrochloride) : ORAL 4,477.50 NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID
Ampicillin 500 mg vl (IM, IV }{ as NON-
3 100 vl sodium salt ) : INJ. 544.00 NOBID RESPONSIVE NOBID NO BID NOBID
Anti Tetanus Serum { equine ) 1500 NON-
4 5000 | vi/amp fi 7 mil 1 mivi 7 amp (M) - ING. 140,000.00 NOBID NO BID NO BID RESPONSIVE 135,000.00
Ascorbic Acid { Vitamin C } 500 mg NON-
5 15,000 tab tab : ORAL 8,700.00 NOBID NO BID NO BID 8,250.00 RESPONSIVE
Ascorbic Acid ( Vitamin C } 100 mg / NON-
6 288 bl 5 ml syr 60 m : ORAL 3,219.84 NOBID NO BID NO BID 3211.20 RESPONSIVE
7| w0 | o [N IOMIEOUS Grade: 482.00 46000  NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID
: NON-
8 500 tab  |Atenolol 50 mg tab : ORAL 660.00 NOBID 310.00 NOBID RESPONSIVE NOBID
9 | 50 [suppository gﬁm' 5 mg ( chiidren ) supp 125000  NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID
Budesonide 250 meq / mi 2 mi { unit
10 | 1,500 neb  |dose): RESP. SOL'N. { for 42,000.00 NQBID 40,935.00 NOBID NOBID NOBID
nebulization}
Cefalexin 100 mg / ml granules / NON-
1 144 btl powder for drops 15 ml { as 2,704.32 2,476.80 NOBID NOBID NO BID
RESPONSIVE
monghydrate): ORAL
Cefixime 20 mg / ml granules for NON-
12 144 bti drops / suspension 10 mi : ORAL 40,032.00 38,160.00 NO BID NOBID RESPONSIVE NOBID
Ceftriaxone 1 g v 10 mi diluent { iV ) NON- NON-
13 500 v ( as disodium / sodium salt ) : INJ. 12.650.00 NO BID 11,645.00 NOBID RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE
Cefuroxime 750 mg vl ( IM, IV ) { as NON-
14 500 i sodium sait ) - INJ. 8,600.00 NOBID RESPONSIVE NOBID NO BID 8,600.00




ONICARE JRACS
ftem . Approved Budget | - PHARMA ENDURE | oerzeros. | CARACHEN | pyarmaceu-
Qty. Unit |ltems for the Contract TRADING & PHARMACEU-
No. MEDICAL, INC. |PHILIPPINES, INC. TICAL
(ABC) GENERAL TICALS, INC. DISTRIBUTOR
MERCHANDISE
Chioramphenicol 1 g vl ( IV, IMif NON-
15 20 vl recommended by manufacturer } { 308.60 NOBID NOBID NQBID NO BID
. : ) RESPONSIVE
as sodium succinate ) : INJ.
Chloramphenicol 125 mg / § ml susp NON- NON-
6] 3 b |60 mi ( as palmitate ) : ORAL 1452000 pecponsive] VO PP NOBID RESPONSIVE 1,008.00
Cloxacillin 125 mg / 5 mi powder for NON- NON-
17 720 bl Zy;zusp 60 mi { as sodium sait ) : 11,404.80 RESPONSIVE NOBID NO BID 11,376.00 RESPONSIVE
Co- Amoxictav { Amoxicillin +
potassium clavulanate ) 500 mg NON- NON- NON- NON-
18 (20000 |t | oyicilin ( as rihydrate ) 125 mg 235200000 peoonsve|  RESPONSVE|  RESPONSVE| Responsive| 200009
|potassium clavulanate / tab : ORAL
19 | 1,000 tab Colchicine 500 meg tab : ORAL 2,500.00] 2,250.00 NOBID NO BID NO BID RESPONhISCI)\l;II::
Cotrimoxazole { sulfamethoxazole +
trimethoprim ) 800 mg NON-
20 3,000 tab Isulfam ethoxazole 160 mg 2,730.00 NO BID NOBID NOBID RESPONSIVE 2,670.00
trimethoprim / tab : ORAL
Dicycloverine { Dicyclomine ) 10 mg NON-
21 | 1,500 tab |1 as hycrochioride ) : ORAL 360.000 NOBID NO BID NOBID 39000|  LeenonsivE
Ferrous Salt 30 mg elemental iron / NON-
22 72 bt 5 mi syr 60 mi : ORAL 858.96 NOBID NOBID NO BID 856.80 RESPONSIVE
n| 0 | paen ﬁg‘;"arg”“'"a‘e (Nitroglycerin } 3 362100  NOBD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
| 2 spray S;f;;"' Trinitrate ( Niroglycerin ) 85000] NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
25 300 tab Glipizide 5 mg fab : ORAL 1,085.00 NOQ BID NOBID NO BID 1,092.00 NOBID
Hydrocortisone 125 mg / ml 2 mi vl { MNON-
26 100 vl IV} { as sodium succinate ) : INJ. 3,210.00 NOBID RESPONSIVE NOBID NOBID NG BID
Hyoscine 10 mg tab { as N-
27 | 2500 tab Butylbrormide ) : ORAL 4,550.00 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID
28 140 tab Irbesartan 150 mg tab : ORAL 2,947.00 NO BID 2,783.20 NOBID NOBID NCBID
29 500 tab Isoniazid 400 mg tab : ORAL 460.00 NO BID NOBID NCBID 400.00r NOBID
Isoniazid 200 mg /5 mlsyr 60 mi . NON-
30 36 bl ORAL 554.40 NC BID NOBID NOBID RESPONSIVE 547.20
3 | 3 | amp  [iSOSOMDCe Dinirate 1 mg fmi 10 m 177780  NOBID - NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
_ . ; amp { V) INJ. : : , _ . _ .




ONICARE , JRACS
e . | Approved Sudgel - _PHARNA ENDURE | GETZBROS. | CARACHEM 1 pyjppmaceu-
Qty. Unit |ltems for the Contract TRADING & PHARMACEU-
No. MEDICAL, INC. |PHILIPPINES, INC. TICAL
{ABC) GENERAL TICALS, INC. DISTRIBUTOR
| MERCHANDISE
Isosorbide Dinitrate 5 mg tab :
32 1,500 tab SUBLINGUAL 7,200.00 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NQBID
Lactulose 3.3 g/ 5 ml { 66% ) syr
33 72 bit 120 mi - ORAL 8,496.00 NOBID NO BID 7.697.52 NOBID NO BID
i ) NON-
34 | 5000 tab Lagundi 600 mg tab : ORAL 21,000.00 NO BID NOBID NOBID 20,950.00 RESPONSIVE
Vitex Negundo L. { Lagundi Leaf ) NON- NON-
35 [ 2180 [ O lang g /5 mi syr: ORAL 14242400 cespongive|  NOBIP NOBID REsPONSvE| 10454400
Levothyroxine 100 meg tab { as
36 500 tab anhydrous sodium ) : ORAL 5,500.00 NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID NO BID
Lidocaine 2 %, 50 ml v ( epidural,
37 6 v Jlocal infiltration } as hydrochloride : 390.00 NO BID 383.34 NOBID NOBID NOBID
INJ
Loperamide 2 mg cap ( as
38 1,500 cap hydrochloride ) : ORAL ( N. B. not 645.00 NO BID NOBID NO BID 645.00] NOBID
for infants and children)
Losartan 50 mg tab { as potassiun NON- NON-
39 | 20,000 tab salt ) - ORAL 33,800.00 NO BID RESPONSIVE NOBID RESPONSIVE 22,400.00
a0 | 500 | tabreap g‘;ﬁ""m 100 mg tab /cap: s000|  NoBID NO BID NO BID 42500| NoBD
Mefenamic Acid 500 mg tab / cap NON-
41 | 20,000 | tab/cap ORAL 8,200.00 NO BID RESPONSIVE NOBID NOBID 8,200.00
2| w0 [ o [Hehpredionedmai: 2085000  NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID
Metformin 500 mg tab / film coated MNON- NON-
43 [ 20000 | tablo) o hydrochioride ) : ORAL 1200000 peopongve|  NOEP NOBID RESPONSIVE 11,000.00
IMetoclopramide 5 mg / 5 ml syr 60
44 72 bit mi { as base and as hydrochloride ) : 1,259.28 NO BID NO BID NOBID 1,242.00 NOBID
ORAL
45 500 tab Metronidazole 500 mg tab : CRAL 2490.00 NO BID NO BID NOBID 285.00 NO BID
— ‘ NON-
46 | 20,000 | tab!cap |Multivitamins tab / cap : ORAL 13,800.00 NOBID NO BID NO BID RESPONSIVE 13,400.00
Naloxene 400 meg / ml 1 ml amp (
a7 3 amp IM, IV, SC ) { as hydrochloride ) - 1,133.10 NOQ BID NQBID NOBID NO BID NO BID
Nicardipine 1 mg /ml 10 ml amp { IV
48 20 amp ) as hydrochloride )  INJ. 26,000.00 NOBID NOBID NOBID NCBID 26,000.00
49 1,500 cap Nifedipine 5 mg cap : ORAL 1,650.00 NOBID NQ BID NOBID 1,635.00 NOBID
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ONICARE _ JRACS
flem . Approved Budget | PHARMA ENDURE | GETZBRos. | CARAGHEM | o emaceu-
Qty. Unit |Items for the Contract TRADING & PHARMACEU-
No. MEDICAL, INC. |PHILIPPINES, INC. TICAL
(ABC) GENERAL TICALS, INC. DISTRIBUTOR
MERCHANDISE
Oxytocin 5iu/mi 1 mlamp { IM, IV} NON-
50 50 amp CINJ. 750.00 700.00 NOBID NOBID NOBID RESPONSIVE
Paracetamol { Acetaminophen ) 300
) 1,000 tab mg (325 mg) tab.: ORAL 1,000.00 NO BID NO BID NOBID NC BID NO BID
Paracetamol { Acetaminophen ) 500 NON- NON-
52 | 10,000 tab mg tab : ORAL 2,300.00 NO BID RESPONSIVE NO BID 2,200.00 RESPONSIVE
Paracetamol { Acetaminophen ) 100 NON- NON-
53 144 bt gig R}i lr.nl drops 15 ml { alcohol free ) : 1,820.16 1,800.00 NO BID NOBID RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE
Paracetamol ( Acetaminophen ) 120 NON- NON-
54 720 btl mg/Sml(125mg/5ml})syr/susp 8,712.00 8,625.60 NOBID NOBID
60 mi ( aicohol free ) : ORAL RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE
.. |Paracetamol 125 mg supp : NON-
55 200 suppository | e ra 5,490.00 NOBID 4,866.00 NO BID NOBID RESPONSIVE
Paracetamol 150 mg/ 1 ml 2 mi NON-
56 50 amp amp: INJ 1,950.00 RESPONSIVE 644,00 NO BID NOBID NOBID
&7 20 tab Phenaobarbital 15 mg tab : ORAL 28 60| NO BID NOBID NGOG BID NO BID NQBID
58 | 50 y  [Potassium Chioride 2 meq /ml 20 mi 224450  NOBID 224400]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
vi{IVinf):INJ.
Regular Insulin { Recombinant DNA,
59 50 vl Hurman ) 100iu / ml 10 mi vl { M, IV, 13,724.50 NG BID NQBID 12,500.00 NO BID NQ BID
SCH:INJ.
Salbutamol 2 mg / ml 2.5 ml { unit NON- NON-
0 a0 neb |dose)( a su!fate }: RESP. SOL'N. 1,350.00 RESPONSIVE 476.10 NO 8ID RESPONSIVE NQBID
{ for nebulization )
61 { 10,000 tab  |Simvastatin 40 mg tab : ORAL 35,500.00 NON- NO BID NO BID NON- 28,900.00
: glab: o RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE o
62 200 tab Spironolactone 25 mg tab : ORAL 3,068.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 3,050.00] NOQ BID
Tetanus Toxoid 0.5 ml amp (IM ) : NON-
63 | 4,000 amp o 140,000.00 NOBID RESPONSIVE NOBID NOBID NOBID
64 | 10 | amp E"}a"l‘;‘j 100 mg /mi 1 mi amp /v { 100000  NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID NO BID
Tramadol 50 mg / ml 2 ml amg ( IM,
85 50 amp IV, SC) { as hydrochloride ) : INJ. 564.50 NOBID §09.50 NQ BID NOBID NO BID
6 [ 500 | cap  [(aarmeA 230mg cap 145000  NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tranexamic Acid 500 mg cap / tab : NON- NON-
67 500 cap _f.tab ORAL 2475.00 2,350..00 NO BID . NOBID RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE
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ONICARE JRACS
ftem . Approved Budget [ PHARMA ENDURE GETzBROS. | CARACHEM 1 o ARMACEU.
Qty. Unit |Items for the Contract TRADING & PHARMACEU-
Ne. MEDICAL, INC. |PHILIPPINES, INC. TICAL
{ABC) GENERAL TICALS, INC. DISTRIBUTOR
MERCHANDISE
Tranexamic Acid 100 mg/ml 5 ml NON-
68 30 amp amp { IM, 1V} £ INJ. 825.00 RESPONSIVE 488.70 NQBID NO BID NOBID
Vitamin Bt B6 B12 100 mg 5 mg 50 NON-
69 | 20,000 | tab/cap mog /1ab / cap ; ORAL 11,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 11,200.00] RESPONSIVE
Balanced Multiple Maintainance
Solution with 5 % Dextrose 1 L bot |
70 48 bt children and adults ) { IV Inf) - INJ. { 217200 NC BID 2,165.76 NOBID NO BID NO BID
with acetate )
5 % Dextrose in Water 250 ml bot { NON-
[ 10 bY IV Inf and as vehicle for iV 300.00 NOBID RESPONSIVE NO BID NOBID NOBID
5 % Dextrose in Water 1 L bot { 1V NON-
2] 60 b ofusion and as vehicle for IV 1780201 NOBID Responsive| VOB NOBID NOBID
73 10 set I Cannula G 16 350.00 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID
NON-
74 50 set IV Cannula G 18 999.00 NQBID 649.50 NO BID NO BID RESPONSIVE
75 10 set Spinal Needle G 25 149.50 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ITOTAL AMOUNT OF BID 1,044,341.96 56,822.40 68,100.10 20,197.52 68,318.00| 562,269.20|
Form of Bid Security BSD BSD BSD B3D BSD
Bank/Company NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A
Number N/A N/A NA A N/A
Validity Period N/A N/A N/A NA N/A
Bid Security Amount NA N{A N/A N/A NIA
Reguired Bid Security NIA N{A N/A NIA N/A
Sufficient/Insufficient N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Remarks COMPLYING | COMPLYING COMPLYING COMPLYING | COMPLYING
FLORENCIO T. MONGOSO, JR. LEON B. IANO IV PERF . BRAGAIS Ill
Chairman, BAC Vice Ghairman, BAC Member
ART . AB L EL M. OLIVER FRANK N™MENDOZA
mber Member Member
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NCPC Rep.- Observer

COA Rep. - Observer
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