

ABSTRACT OF BIDS AS CALCULATED**Project Name: Supply and Delivery of Medicines**

Sheet: 1

Project Location: CHO

Date: August 7, 2015

Implementing Office: CHO

Time: 10:00 AM

Approved Budget for the Contract : P 1,760,176.27

Venue: City Procurement Office

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GENERAL MERCHANDISE	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR	GETZ BROS. PHILIPPINES, INC.	ENDURE MEDICAL, INC.	CARACHEM PHARMACEUTICALS, INC.	NATRAPHARM INC.	
1	144	bottles	Aluminum Hydroxide 225 mg + Mg Hydroxide 200 mg/120 ml	16,689.60	NON-RESPONSIVE	7,776.00	NO BID	NO-BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
2	5,000	tablets	Amlodipine Besilate 5 mg Tablet	4,500.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	2,950.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	
3	10,000	capsules	Amoxicillin Trihydrate 500 mg Capsule	15,000.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	13,300.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
4	432	bottles	Amoxicillin Trihydrate 100 mg/ml Drops 10 ml	7,257.60	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO-BID	5,616.00	NO BID	
5	720	bottles	Amoxicillin Trihydrate 125 mg Suspension 60 ml	12,168.00	11,592.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO-BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
6	200	ampoules	Anti-Tetanus Serum 1,500 'u'/ml	4,900.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	
7	5,000	tablets	Aspirin 80 mg tablet	5,500.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	4,150.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
8	500	tablets	Azithromycin 500 mg Tablet	15,725.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	9,745.00	NO BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	
9	3,000	tablets	Butamirate 50 mg Tablet	75,000.00	45,000.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	
10	288	bottles	Butamirate 7.5 mg/5 ml Syrup 60 ml	40,320.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	
11	30	bottles	Calamine 8% Lotion 60 ml	3,900.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	
12	3,000	tablets	Calcium 500 mg + Vit. D 200 mg Tablet	2,700.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	
13	2,000	tablets	Carbamazepine 200 mg Tablet	9,800.00	NO BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	7,680.00	NO BID	NO BID	

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GENERAL MERCHANDISE	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR	GETZ BROS. PHILIPPINES, INC.	ENDURE MEDICAL, INC.	CARACHEM PHARMACEUTICALS, INC.	NATRAPHARM INC.	
14	2,000	capsules	Captopril 25 mg Capsule	2,300.00	NO BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	1,140.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
15	5,000	capsules	Cefalexin Monohydrate 500 mg Capsule	13,000.00	11,000.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO-BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
16	1,000	capsules	Cefixime 200 mg Capsule	31,000.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	18,480.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
17	200	vials	Ceftriaxone 1 gm/IV	6,960.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	4,178.00	NO BID	NO BID	
18	72	bottles	Cefixime 100 mg/5 ml Syrup	18,000.00	14,760.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO-BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
19	432	bottles	Cefuroxime Axetil 125 mg/ml Syrup 50 ml	48,384.00	NO BID	48,288.96	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	
20	4,000	tablets	Cefuroxime Axetil 500 mg film-coated Tablet	60,000.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	48,000.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	
21	3,000	capsules	Celecoxib 200 mg Capsule	23,400.00	18,000.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO-BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
22	576	bottles	Cetirizine Dihydrochloride 5mg/5m Syrup 30ml	23,040.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	
23	5,000	tablets	Cetirizine Dihydrochloride 10 mg Tablet	7,000.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	3,600.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
24	1,000	capsules	Chloramphenicol 500 mg Capsule	3,500.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	NO-BID	3,045.00	NO BID	
25	144	bottles	Chloramphenicol 125 mg/5 ml Suspension	3,600.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO-BID	3,027.60	NO BID	
26	3,000	tablets	Ciprofloxacin 500 mg Tablet	5,550.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	4,170.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
27	72	bottles	Clarithromycin 125 mg/5 ml Suspension	9,856.80	NO BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO-BID	9,720.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	
28	1,000	tablets	Clarithromycin 500 mg Tablet	16,000.00	NO BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	11,390.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	
29	2,000	capsules	Clindamycin 300 mg Capsule	6,960.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	3,380.00	NO BID	NO BID	
30	30	bottles	Clindamycin 75 mg/5 ml Suspension 60 ml	14,400.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	


Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GENERAL MERCHANDISE	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR	GETZ BROS. PHILIPPINES, INC.	ENDURE MEDICAL, INC.	CARACHEM PHARMACEUTICALS, INC.	NATRAPHARM INC.	
31	2,000	tablets	Clopidogrel 75 mg Tablet	13,000.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	4,380.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	
32	10,000	capsules	Cloxacillin 500 mg Capsule	36,000.00	24,500.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO-BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
33	720	bottles	Cloxacillin 125 mg/5 ml Suspension 60 ml	15,768.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO-BID	13,833.00	NO BID	
34	3,000	tablets	Co-Amoxiclav 625 mg Tablet	45,750.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	30,000.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	
35	288	bottles	Co-Amoxiclav 228 mg Suspension	50,112.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	42,912.00	
36	432	bottles	Cotrimoxazole 200 mg Suspension	7,862.40	6,912.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO-BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
37	5,000	tablets	Cotrimoxazole 400 mg Tablet	4,000.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO-BID	3,842.50	NO BID	
38	20	ampoules	Diazepam 5 mg/ml, 2 ml	2,400.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	2,394.80	NO BID	NO BID	
39	144	bottles	Dicycloverine Hydrochloride 10 mg/5 ml Syrup 30 ml	2,980.80	NO BID	2,894.40	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	
40	1,000	tablets	Dicycloverine Hydrochloride 10 mg Tablet	460	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO-BID	400.00	NO BID	
41	2,000	tablets	Digoxin 250 mg microgram Tablet	8,200.00	8,200.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	
42	50	ampoules	Diphenhydramine 50 mg/ml, 1 ml	2,250.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	1,489.50	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
43	432	capsules	Diphenhydramine 12.5 mg/5 ml Suspension 70 ml	6,955.20	6,912.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	
44	4,000	capsules	Diphenhydramine 25 mg Capsule	3,400.00	NO BID	3,400.00	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	
45	10	bottles	Dopamine 1.6 mg/ml 250 ml (DSW) premixed	6,200.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	6,195.00	NO BID	NO BID	
46	200	bottles	D5W 500 cc	17,000.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	6,844.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
47	200	bottles	D5.3 NaCl 500 cc	17,000.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	6,844.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GENERAL MERCHANDISE	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR	GETZ BROS. PHILIPPINES, INC.	ENDURE MEDICAL, INC.	CARACHEM PHARMACEUTICALS, INC.	NATRAPHARM INC.	
48	100	bottles	D5.9% NaCl 500 cc	8,500.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	5,195.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
49	200	bottles	D5 LR 500 cc	17,000.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	8,510.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
50	100	vials	D50% 50 cc	6,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	2,949.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
51	3	ampoules	Epinephrine 1 mg/ml (1,1000)	2,850.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	113.85	NO BID	NO BID	
52	144	bottles	Ferrous Sulfate 15 mg/6 ml Drops 15 ml	2,736.00	NO BID	2,656.80	NO BID	NO-BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
53	5,000	bottles	Ferrous Sulfate 60 mg + Folic Acid 250 mg Tablet/Capsule	5,500.00	NO BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	4,600.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
54	288	bottles	Ferrous Sulfate 30 mg/ml	4,838.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	
55	10,000	tablets	Ferrous Sulfate 60 mg Tablet	6,000.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	5,900.00	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	
56	200	tablets	Finofibrate 160 mg Tablet/Capsule	7,600.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	
57	50	inhaler	Fluticasone + Salmeterol 50/250 Inhaler	21,500.00	20,500.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	
58	30	tubes	Fusidic Acid 2 %, 5 gm Cream	10,410.00	NO BID	10,410.00	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	
59	100	ampoules	Furosemide 10 mg/ml, 2 ml	1,500.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	759.00	NO BID	NO BID	
60	3,000	tablets	Furosemide 40 mg Tablet	3,000.00	2,400.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	
61	2,000	tablets	Gliclazide 30 mg Tablet	7,900.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	
62	100	tubes	Hydrocortisone 1 % Cream - 5 gm	15,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	
63	50	vials	Hydrocortisone 100 mg - powder	2,000.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	1,174.50	NO BID	NO BID	
64	50	ampoules	Hyoscine 20 mg/m, 1 ml Ampoule	6,825.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	1,997.50	NO BID	NO BID	

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GENERAL MERCHANDISE	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR	GETZ BROS. PHILIPPINES, INC.	ENDURE MEDICAL, INC.	CARACHEM PHARMACEUTICALS, INC.	NATRAPHARM INC.	
65	200	tablets	Hyoscine 10 mg Tablet	10,600.00	2,400.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	
66	70	vials	Insulin, Regular 100 iu/ml	45,500.00	NO BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	17,500.00	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	
67	500	nebules	Ipratropium 500 microgram	26,750.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	
68	500	nebules	Ipratropium 500 microgram + Salmeterol 2.5, 2.5 ml	8,450.00	8,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	
69	10,000	tablets	Isoniazid 75 mg + Rifampicin 150 mg Tablet + Ethambutol	95,000.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	52,500.00	
70	8,000	tablets	Isoniazid 75 mg + Rifampicin 150 mg + Pyrazinamide 400 + Etham	63,200.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO-BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	43,200.00	
71	70	vials	Isophane Human Insulin/NPH Human Insulin 100 iu/ml, 10 ml	45,500.17	NO BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	17,500.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	
72	2,000	tablets	Isosorbide, Dinitrate (ISDN) 5 mg Tablet	21,960.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	
73	500	tablets	Levothyroxine 100 mg Tablet	5,250.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	
74	100	vials	Lidocaine hcl 2%/ 10 ml	4,120.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	
75	10,000	tablets	Losartan 50 mg Tablet	20,000.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	11,200.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
76	5,000	tablets	Loratadine 10 mg Tablet	11,500.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	9,450.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
77	10,000	capsules	Mefenamic Acid 500 mg Capsule/Tablet	5,000.00	NO BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	4,900.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
78	144	bottles	Mefenamic Acid 50mg/5ml Suspension	8,640.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	2,993.76	NO BID	NO-BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
79	10,000	tablets	Metformin 500 mg Tablet	7,000.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	6,600.00	NO BID	NO-BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	
80	50	ampoules	Metoclopramide 5 mg/ml, 2 ml Ampule	2,787.50	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	269.50	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
81	144	bottles	Metoclopramide 5 mg/5 ml Syrup	2,664.00	2,592.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO-BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GENERAL MERCHANDISE	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR	GETZ BROS. PHILIPPINES, INC.	ENDURE MEDICAL, INC.	CARACHEM PHARMACEUTICALS, INC.	NATRAPHARM INC.	
82	1,000	tablets	Metoclopramide 10 mg Tablet	1,180.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	1,000.00	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	
83	5,000	tablets	Metoprolol 50 mg Tablet	45,000.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	4,450.00	NO BID	NO-BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
84	144	bottles	Metronidazole 125mg Suspension	2,664.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO-BID	2,500.00	NO BID	
85	2,000	tablets	Metromidazole 500 mg Tablet	2,800.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	2,440.00	NO BID	NO-BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
86	288	bottles	Metromidazole 125 mg/5 ml 60 ml Suspension	5,702.40	5,126.40	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO-BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
87	100	tablets	Montelukast 4 mg Chewable Tablet	2,100.00	NO BID	NO BID	1,706.00	NO-BID	NO BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	
88	200	tubes	Mupirocin 2 % Cream	22,680.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	16,978.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
89	5,000	tablets	Omeprazole 40 mg Tablet	36,000.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	24,750.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO-BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
90	3,000	sachets	Oral Rehydration Salt (ORS-75) 2.17 gm	15,900.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	10,170.00	NO BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	
91	200	ampoules	Oxytocin 10 i.u/ml IV	2,630.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	1,798.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
92	288	bottles	Paracetamol 100 mg/ml Drops 15 ml	4,521.60	4,291.20	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO-BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
93	720	bottles	Paracetamol 125 mg/5 ml Syrup 60 ml	12,096.00	10,728.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO-BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
94	20,000	tablets	Paracetamol 500 mg Tablet	6,000.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	4,600.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
95	50	vials	Penicillin G Benzathine 1, 200, 000 units vial	7,800.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	7,750.00	NO BID	NO BID	
96	2,000	tablets	Prednisone 5 mg Tablet	1,900.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	1,260.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
97	72	bottles	Prednisone 10mg/5ml Suspension	9,025.20	NO BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO-BID	8,874.00	NO BID	
98	100	vials	Rabies Purified Vaccine 2.5 g + diluent 1 cc	150,000.00	NO BID	150,000.00	NO BID	NO-BID	NO BID	NO BID	

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GENERAL MERCHANDISE	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR	GETZ BROS. PHILIPPINES, INC.	ENDURE MEDICAL, INC.	CARACHEM PHARMACEUTICALS, INC.	NATRAPHARM INC.	
Required Bid Security					N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Sufficient/Insufficient					N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Remarks					COMPLYING	COMPLYING	COMPLYING	COMPLYING	COMPLYING	COMPLYING	


FLORENCIO T. MONGOSO, JR.
 Chairman, BAC


ARTHUR F. ABONAL
 Member


LEON B. PADRIANO IV
 Vice Chairman, BAC

REUEL M. OLIVER
 Member


PERFECTO N. BRAGAIS III
 Member


FRANK M. MENDOZA
 Member

PMO-End-user Unit

MNCCI Rep.-Observer

NCPC Rep. - Observer

COA Rep. - Observer