

Standard Form Number: SF-GOOD-40
Revised on: May 24, 2004**ABSTRACT OF BIDS AS CALCULATED**Project Name: **SUPPLY & DELIVERY OF MEDICINES**Project Location: **N C H**Implementing Office: **N C H**Approved Budget for the Contract : **P 1,179,777.60**Sheet: 1
Date: July 24, 2014
Time: 10:00 AM
Venue: CPDO

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	EURO-MED LAB. PHIL., INC.	ENDURE MEDICAL INC.	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR	RBC-MDC CORPORATION	
1	144	btl	225 mg Aluminum Hydroxide 200 mg Magnesium Hydroxide/5 ml susp 120 ml : ORAL	3,225.60	NO BID	NO BID	2,851.20	NO BID	
2	20,000	tab	Amlodipine 10 mg tab (as besilate/camsylate) : ORAL	10,800.00	NO BID	10,760.00	NO BID	NO BID	
3	5,000	cap	Amoxicillin 250 mg cap (as trihydrate) : ORAL	3,950.00	NO BID	3,900.00	NO BID	NO BID	
4	20,000	cap	Amoxicillin 500 mg cap (as trihydrate) : ORAL	23,400.00	NO BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	
5	10,000	tab	Aspirin 80 mg tab : ORAL	9,800.00	NO BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	9,700.00	NO BID	
6	20	vl	Biphasic Isophane human insulin 70/30 (recombinant DNA) 70 % isophane suspension + 30% soluble insulin in 100 iu/ml 10 ml vl IM, IV) : INJ.	6,200.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
7	100	suppository	Bisacodyl 10 mg (adult) supp : RECTAL	1,010.00	NO BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	EURO-MED LAB. PHIL., INC.	ENDURE MEDICAL INC.	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR	RBC-MDC CORPORATION	
8	10,000	tab	Captopril 25 mg tab : ORAL	6,700.00	NO BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	6,600.00	NO BID	
9	15,000	cap	Celecoxib 200 mg cap : ORAL	143,550.00	NO BID	NO BID	120,000.00	NO BID	
10	20	vl	Chloramphenicol 1 g vl (IV, IM if recommended by manufacturer) (as sodium succinate) : INJ.	311.80	NO BID	308.60	NO BID	NO BID	
11	720	btl	Cloxacillin 125 mg/5 ml powder for syr/susp 60 ml (as sodium salt) : ORAL	11,412.00	NO BID	NO BID	11,404.80	NO BID	
12	288	btl	Dextromethorpan 5 mg/5 ml syr 60 ml (alcohol free) (as hydrobromide) : ORAL	3,571.20	NO BID	NO BID	3,571.20	NO BID	
13	20	btl	Dopamine 200 mg/250 ml D5W (pre-mixed) (IV) (as hydrochloride) : INJ.	7,900.00	NO BID	7,900.00	NO BID	NO BID	
14	144	btl	Erythromycin 200 mg/5 ml granules/powder for susp 60 ml (as ethyl succinate) : ORAL	4,896.00	NO BID	NO BID	4,860.00	NO BID	
15	20,000	tab	Ferrous Salt tab equivalent to 60 mg elemental iron : ORAL N.B. elem. Iron content of a ferrous salt depends on the type of prep.	11,400.00	NO BID	NO BID	11,400.00	NO BID	
16	150	tube	Fluocinonide 0.5 % 5 g tube : CREAM	34,050.00	34,050.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	


Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	EURO-MED LAB. PHIL., INC.	ENDURE MEDICAL INC.	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR	RBC-MDC CORPORATION	
17	150	tube	Fusidate Sodium/Fusidic Acid 2 % 5 g tube : Cream	44,250.00	NO BID	44,233.50	NO BID	NO BID	
18	2,000	tab	Furosemide 40 mg tab : ORAL	1,100.00	NO BID	NO BID	1,040.00	NO BID	
19	50	amp	Hyoscine 20 mg/ml 1 ml amp (IM, IV, SC) (as N-butylbromide) : INJ.	640.00	NO BID	579.00	NO BID	NO BID	
20	10,000	neb	500 mcg (pratropium (as bromide anhydrous) 2.5 mg Salbutamol (as base) x 2.5 ml (unit dose) : RESP. SOL'N. (for nebulization)	192,500.00	NO BID	133,900.00	NO BID	NO BID	
21	100	vl	Isophane Insulin Human (Recombinant DNA) 100 iu/ml 10 ml vl (IM, SC) : INJ.	28,000.00	NO BID	27,950.00	NO BID	NO BID	
22	10	amp	isosorbide Dinitrate 1 mg/ml 10 ml amp (IV) INJ.	627.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
23	72	btl	Lactulose 3.3 g/5 ml (66%) syr 120 ml : ORAL	8,496.00	NO BID	8,496.00	NO BID	NO BID	
24	10,000	tab	Loratadine 10 mg tab: ORAL	24,200.00	NO BID	20,500.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
25	144	btl	Metoclopramide 5 mg/5 ml syr 60 ml (as base and as hydrochloride) : ORAL	2,534.40	NO BID	NO BID	2,518.56	NO BID	
26	144	btl	Multivitamins/ml drops : ORAL	1,893.60	NO BID	NO BID	1,893.60	NO BID	

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	EURO-MED LAB. PHIL., INC.	ENDURE MEDICAL INC.	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR	RBC-MDC CORPORATION	
27	150	tube	Mupirocin 2% 5 g : CREAM	22,350.00	NO BID	NO BID	22,350.00	NO BID	
28	10	amp	Nicardipine 1 mg/ml 10 ml amp (IV) (as hydrochloride) : INJ.	12,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
29	2,000	tab	Norflloxacin 400 mg tab : ORAL	3,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	2,960.00	NO BID	
30	10,000	tab	Paracetamol (Acetaminophen) 300 mg (325 mg) tab : ORAL	45,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
31	720	btl	Paracetamol (Acetaminophen) 120 mg/5 ml (125 mg/5 ml) syr/susp 60 ml (alcohol free) : ORAL	8,769.60	NO BID	NO BID	8,762.40	NO BID	
32	200	suppository	Paracetamol 125 mg supp : RECTAL	1,548.00	NO BID	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	
33	10	vl	Penicillin G Benzathine (Benzathine benzylpenicillin) 1,200,000 units vl (IV) (IM) : INJ	920.00	NO BID	918.40	NO BID	NO BID	
34	20	vl	Penicillin G Crystalline (benzylpenicillin) 1,000,000 units vl (IM, IV) (as sodium salt) : INJ.	120.00	NO BID	119.20	NO BID	NO BID	
35	10,000	tab	Rosuvastatin Calcium 10 mg tab : ORAL	229,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	125,000.00	
36	10,000	tab	Simvastatin 40 mg tab : ORAL	35,900.00	NO BID	NO BID	35,500.00	NO BID	

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	EURO-MED LAB. PHIL., INC.	ENDURE MEDICAL INC.	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR	RBC-MDC CORPORATION	
37	70,000	tab/cap	Vitamin B1 B6 B12 100 mg 5 mg 50 mcg/tab/cap : ORAL	40,600.00	NO BID	NO BID	40,600.00	NO BID	
38	120	btl	Balanced Multiple Maintenance Solution with 5 % Dextrose 500 ml bot (infants) (IV Inf) : INJ. (with acetate)	5,865.60	5,292.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	
39	120	btl	Balanced Multiple Maintenance Solution with 5 % Dextrose 1 L bot (children and adults) (IV Inf) : INJ. (with acetate)	5,865.60	5,430.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	
40	240	btl	Balanced Multiple Maintenance Solution with 5 % Dextrose 500 ml bot (IV Inf) : INJ. (with phosphate)	11,731.20	10,860.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	
41	120	btl	5 % Dextrose in Lactated Ringer's 500 ml bot (IV Inf) : INJ.	5,865.60	5,430.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	
42	720	btl	5 % Dextrose in Lactated Ringer's 1 L bot (IV Inf) : INJ.	35,193.60	31,320.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	
43	720	btl	5 % Dextrose in 0.3 % Sodium Chloride 500 ml bot (IV Inf) : INJ.	35,193.60	31,320.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	
44	120	btl	5 % Dextrose in 0.9 % Sodium Chloride 1 L bot (IV Inf) : INJ.	5,865.60	5,430.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	
45	120	btl	5 % Dextrose in Water 500 ml bot (IV Inf and as which for IV medications) : INJ.	5,865.60	5,430.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	EURO-MED LAB. PHIL., INC.	ENDURE MEDICAL INC.	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR	RBC-MDC CORPORATION	
46	120	btl	0.9 % Sodium Chloride 500 ml bot (IV Inf) : INJ.	5,865.60	5,430.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	
47	720	btl	0.9 % Sodium Chloride 1 L bot (IV Inf) : INJ.	35,193.60	31,320.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	
48	120	btl	Lactated Ringer's Solution (Ringer's lactate) 500 ml bot (IV Inf) : INJ.	5,865.60	5,430.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	
49	240	btl	Lactated Ringer's Solution (Ringer's lactate) 1 L bot (IV Inf) : INJ.	11,731.20	10,584.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	
50	1,000	set	Macro drip	14,800.00	NO BID	14,790.00	NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
51	500	set	Micro drip	9,250.00	NO BID	NO BID	9,250.00	NO BID	
TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID				1,179,777.60	187,326.00	274,354.70	295,261.76	125,000.00	
Form of Bid Security					BSD	BSD	BSD	BSD	
Bank/Company					N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Number					N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Validity Period					N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Bid Security Amount					N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Required Bid Security					N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Sufficient/Insufficient					N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Remarks					COMPLYING	COMPLYING	COMPLYING	COMPLYING	

Item No.	Qty.	Unit	Items	Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	EURO-MED LAB. PHIL., INC.	ENDURE MEDICAL INC.	JRACS PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTOR	RBC-MDC CORPORATION	
----------	------	------	-------	--	---------------------------	---------------------	----------------------------------	---------------------	--


FLORENTO T. MONGOSO, JR.
 Chairman, BAC



LEON B. PALMIANO IV
 Vice Chairman, BAC

PERFECTO N. BRAGAS III
 Member


ARTHUR F. ABONAL
 Member


REUEL M. OLIVER
 Member


FRANK M. MENDOZA
 Member


GAUDENCIO A. ASIS, JR.
 Head, TWG

PMO-End-user Unit

MNCCI Rep.-Observer

NCPC Rep.- Observer